From: Lisa Schovanek

To: Legislative Services
Subject: FW: Banking info
Date: February 5, 2021 9:02:48 AM

From: Layne Quickstad <lquickstad@sturgeoncounty.ca>

Sent: February 5, 2021 8:37 AM

To: Christina Kwok <ckwok@sturgeoncounty.ca>; Sabrina Duquette
<sdugquette@sturgeoncounty.ca>; Dawn Sauve <dsauve@sturgeoncounty.ca>

Cc: Joanne Wynder <jwynder@sturgeoncounty.ca>
Subject: FW: Banking info

Please see below from the ratepayer.

Layne Quickstad

Finance Intern

Sturgeon
County

Financial Services

780.939.8348

780.939.3003

Iquickstad@sturgeoncounty.ca
: www.sturgeoncounty.ca

=0T

From: Bill Henderson <bill@hendersonbuilt.ca>

Sent: February 5, 2021 8:35 AM

To: Layne Quickstad <|quickstad@sturgeoncounty.ca>
Subject: Banking info

Morning

Sorry for the delay | just received this information in the mail . Again it’s not clear it says September
1 it was remitted to the creditor .I'm 99.9% sure we paid this August 31. The point I'm trying to make
is 500+ dollars even if it was processed on September 1 is outrageous for a penalty. I’'m hoping to get
some lenience . Thanks
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Regards,

Bill Henderson
President/Owner
T.780.722.9621
E. 780.973.5180

W. www.hendersongualitybuilding.com


http://www.hendersonqualitybuilding.com/

